
Terms of service WonderWorld 
  

PLEASE READ THESE TERMS OF USE CAREFULLY BEFORE USING THIS SITE AND ITS 
SERVICES OR APPLICATIONS. 
  
UNDER THE KNOW YOUR CUSTOMER (KYC) AND ANTI-MONEY LAUNDERING (AML) 
POLICY, YOU HAVE AGREED TO VERIFY YOUR IDENTITY AND LEGAL AGE OF CONSENT. 
  
YOU AGREE THAT BY USING THE SITE, ITS SERVICES AND ANY APPLICATIONS YOU ARE 
AT LEAST 18 YEARS OF AGE AND YOU ARE LEGALLY ABLE TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT 
IN YOUR JURISDICTION. 

Definitions: 
  
“WonderWorld”, “WonderWorld platform”, "we", "us" and "our" refer to​ ​www.​wonderworld.land 
including ​Wonder World Land ​registered as Fan Me PTY LTD​, an Australian company with registry 
number from the ACN 626 481 481. 
  
“user”, "you" and "your" refer to each customer, or user of the Site. 
  
“the Site” includes ​any content, applications or application plug-ins, Site generated documents, cloud 
solutions or any other proprietary software or content of WonderWorld. 
  
“rules and regulations”, “law”, “legal framework”, “legislation” refers to Australian Federal Law, the 
legislation of South Australia and any other laws and regulations that may apply to Wonderworld’s 
individual users or businesses regardless of geographical location including the European Data Protection 
Regulation (GDPR) as described below in our ​Privacy Policy​. 

“Terms”: refer to the Terms of Service described in this document including any updates and 
modifications as made from time to time. 

It is your responsibility to review these Terms periodically. If at any time you find these Terms 
unacceptable or ​if you do not agree to these Terms, please do not use this Site or its applications.​ We may 
revise these Terms at any time without notice to you. If you have any questions about these Terms, please 
contact us at hello@wonderworld.land 

WonderWorld provides an online platform for interactive applications and e-commerce for users to 
communicate, connect, share and purchase/sell content amongst other users within the convenience of 
their own environment (publicly and privately) and within the applicable legal framework. Our aim is to 
provide our users with a fun and seamless social experience within an online community. 

WonderWorld does not endorse any kind of unlawful activities related to said sharing and interaction and 
reserve the right to immediately suspend or delete the account of users who are found to be in violation of 

http://www.fanme.com/
http://www.fanme.com/


these Terms or applicable laws and regulations. Furthermore, you should notice us immediately at 
hello@wonderworld.land if you are exposed to any queries or content relating to sexual services, child 
pornography, racist, discriminatory, abusive or unsolicited content. 

Wonder World adheres to stringent verification processes to be compliant with the globally implemented 
KYC (Know your customer) and AML (Anti-money Laundering) policies. 

  

  

1. Privacy Policy 

WonderWorld respects your privacy and permits you to control the treatment of your personal 
information. A complete statement of WonderWorld’s current ​Privacy Policy​ can be found below in this 
document and is deemed to be expressly incorporated into these Terms. 

2. Content policy 

2.1 WonderWorld content 

This Site is owned and operated by WonderWorld. All right, title and interest in and to the materials 
provided by WonderWorld on this Site including but not limited to information, documents, logos, 
graphics, sounds and images (the "Materials") are owned either by WonderWorld or by our respective 
third-party authors, developers or vendors ("Third Party Providers"). Except as otherwise expressly 
provided by WonderWorld, none of such Materials may be copied, reproduced, republished, downloaded, 
uploaded, posted, displayed, transmitted or distributed in any way and nothing on this Site shall be 
construed to confer any license under any of WonderWorld’s intellectual property rights, whether by 
estoppel, implication or otherwise. WonderWorld does not sell, license, lease or otherwise provide any of 
the Materials other than those specifically identified as being provided by WonderWorld to you or created 
by you. Any rights not expressly granted herein are reserved by WonderWorld. 

2.2 User content 

To provide for a unique experience, WonderWorld provides for the sharing between users of private 
written photographic and audio-visual content within an uncensored environment. However, we will not 
entertain such use for illegal or abusive practices. Wonder World has zero tolerance when it comes to 
sharing sexual content involving minors. To prevent such practices, we ask that users act responsibly 
regarding the content they share, while being vigilant against content that has no place on this platform. It 
is WonderWorld’s goal to provide a specialized alternative to platforms such as Facebook or Instagram, 
not a channel for inappropriate behaviour, commercial advertising or unlawful acts. 

Consequently, we ask that you read the following CAREFULLY and in its entirety: 



You can control how content is shared according to your user settings and subscription plan (hereinafter 
the “Plan”). 

You alone are responsible for any content or information you enter on your profile and in any 
communication with other users. WonderWorld is not the publisher and only provides a channel for users 
to publish and/or distribute their content. When you delete your shared content, it is deleted in a manner 
similar to emptying the recycle bin on a computer. However, you understand that removed content may 
persist in backup copies for a reasonable period of time (but will not be available to others) being 
understood the time it takes for our system routines to permanently delete data including that of 
non-active users unless you reactivate your profile with us before a reasonable or specifically indicated 
time has passed.  

When you interact in the private space of other users being understood within all areas of Wonder World, 
the private and group spaces, the other users may share content with you. Under no circumstance are you 
permitted to share, copy, divulge or describe such content to other third parties or in any other manner use 
such content otherwise as provided for within the WonderWorld platform, as described within these 
Terms and according to applicable laws and regulations including but not limited to those concerning 
copyrights, privacy and personal data protection 

Under no circumstance may you submit or upload content that is, or may reasonably be considered to be, 
defamatory, libellous, hateful, racially or religiously biased or offensive, unlawfully threatening or 
unlawfully harassing, or advocates or encourages illegal conduct harmful to any individual, partnership or 
corporation; 

that violates any law, statute, ordinance, or regulation and any sexual material relating to minors 
(including, but not limited to, those governing export control, consumer protection, unfair competition, 
anti-discrimination, or false advertising). 

that includes advertisements, spam, or content for which you were compensated or granted any 
consideration by any third party; 

that includes information that references other websites, addresses, email addresses, phone numbers, or 
other third-party contact information for the purpose of services rendered by such third parties; 

that contains any computer virus, worms, or other potentially damaging computer programs or files; 

that otherwise violates these Terms of Use. 

Photos: 

Public Profile - The content of your private photos may not contain illegal material, including 
photographs you only make visible to your private contacts/fans within the private sharing functionality 
of the platform. 



Private Photos - The content of your private photos may not contain illegal material.​ ​It will be at 
WonderWorld's sole discretion to delete suspected illegal content. WonderWorld does not warrant the 
suitability of a member's private photos nor will we become involved in correspondence regarding their 
suitability. 

Video: 

The content of your private videos may not contain illegal material. WonderWorld does not warrant the 
suitability of a member's private videos nor will we become involved in correspondence regarding their 
suitability. 

Other content restrictions: 

You may not publish content that directly or indirectly alludes to child pornography or attempts to solicit 
communication with or on behalf of any person under the age of 18. Furthermore, to prevent any such 
content or attempts, WonderWorld will contact law enforcement directly without notice to have such 
users investigated for criminal offences if we have reason to believe you are not adhering to these Terms 
and applicable law or statutes. 

You may not publish in your public profile any personal contact information unless you have permission 
to do so from Wonder World. This includes but is not restricted to, email addresses, telephone numbers, 
instant messaging contact details (e.g. ICQ numbers, etc) web Site URLs, etc. Personal contact 
information will consequently be removed and is reason for suspension or removal of the user. 

The permission and access to contents and/or WonderWorld may terminate or be suspended without 
notice if you breach or are suspected to be in breach of these Terms. 

NB:​ Users who report other users for any breach without being able to substantiate their claims will get 
their permission and access suspended and may be removed from the platform. 

Additional terms in our ​Privacy Policy​ below. 

3. Forums, reviews, comments, communications, and other public content 

WonderWorld facilitates forum applications that allow visitors to live chat, post ratings, reviews, 
comments, questions, answers, and other content ("Public Content"). Contributions to, access to and use 
of the Public Content is subject to this paragraph and the other terms and conditions of these Terms. 

WonderWorld is not the publisher or author of the Public Content. WonderWorld takes no responsibility 
and assumes no liability for any Public Content posted by you or any third party. 

WonderWorld has the right (but not the obligation), in our sole and absolute discretion, to edit, redact, 
remove, re-categorize to a more appropriate location or otherwise change any Public Content. 



WonderWorld may remove on a discretionary basis infringing content or materials and investigate such 
allegations immediately. 

4.​ ​Copyrights, intellectual property, your relationship with and access to our content 

To the full extent permitted by laws and regulations concerning copyrights, intellectual property, authors’ 
rights and marketing practices you may not for personal or commercial purposes otherwise as permitted 
within and by WonderWorld and the Site use our layout, designs, contents or functionality in any way. 

You expressly agree that you will not remove, circumvent, disable, damage or otherwise interfere with 
security-related features of the WonderWorld services or user content, features that prevent or restrict use 
or copying of any content accessible through the WonderWorld services, features that enforce limitations 
on the use of the WonderWorld services or user content, or delete the copyright or other proprietary rights 
notices on the WonderWorld services or user content; 

reverse engineer, decompile, disassemble or otherwise attempt to discover the source code of the 
WonderWorld services or any part thereof, except and only to the extent that this activity is expressly 
permitted by applicable law; 

modify, adapt, translate or create derivative works based upon the WonderWorld services or any part 
thereof, except and only to the extent that such activity is expressly permitted by applicable law; 

relay email from a third party’s mail servers ; 

access the Site or any website, server, software application, or other computer resource owned, used 
and/or licensed by WonderWorld, including but not limited to WonderWorld services, by means of any 
robot, spider, scraper, crawler or other automated means for any purpose, or bypass any measures 
WonderWorld may use to prevent or restrict access to any website, server, software application, or other 
computer resource owned, used and/or licensed by WonderWorld, including but not limited to the 
WonderWorld services; 

manipulate identifiers in order to disguise the origin of any user content transmitted through the 
WonderWorld services; 

interfere with or disrupt the WonderWorld services or servers or networks connected to the WonderWorld 
services, or disobey any requirements, procedures, policies or regulations of networks connected to the 
WonderWorld services; 

use the WonderWorld services in any manner that could interfere with, disrupt, negatively affect or inhibit 
other users from fully enjoying the WonderWorld services, or that could damage, disable, overburden or 
impair the functioning of the WonderWorld services in any manner; 



use or attempt to use another user’s account without authorisation from that user and WonderWorld 
services; 

attempt to circumvent any content filtering techniques we employ, or attempt to access any service or area 
of the WonderWorld services that you are not authorised to access; 

attempt to indicate in any manner that you have a relationship with us or that we have endorsed you or 
any products or services for any purpose and 

you hereby expressly agree to indemnify WonderWorld for any direct or indirect losses that 
WonderWorld may suffer due to your breach of this clause. 

4.1 WonderWorld and third-party rights 

When accessing WonderWorld or using the WonderWorld’s services, you agree to obey applicable laws 
and you agree to respect the intellectual property rights of others. Your use of the Site and its applications 
is at all times governed by and subject to laws regarding copyright, trademark and other intellectual 
property ownership. You agree not to upload, download, display, perform, transmit or otherwise distribute 
any information or content in violation of any third party's copyrights, trademarks or other intellectual 
property or proprietary rights. You agree to abide by laws regarding copyright ownership and use of 
intellectual property, and you shall be solely responsible for any violations of any relevant laws and for 
any infringements of third-party rights caused by your actions or any content you provide or transmit or 
that is provided or transmitted using your WonderWorld user account. 

WonderWorld has adopted a policy that provides for the immediate removal of any content, article or 
materials that have infringed rights of WonderWorld or of a third party or that violate intellectual property 
rights generally. 

All Site design, text, graphics, the selection and arrangement thereof are the property and distinctive 
impressions of WonderWorld. You expressly agree to not in any way reuse, replicate or display such or 
similar content in a way that may lead to the confusion of this Site with other sites or services. 

4.2 User content 

Depending on your Plan and/or WonderWorld functionality, content may be locked to your user account 
or be unlocked and released to users paying for the content. 

You hereby agree that by releasing unlocked content to the public via the Site you are making such 
content generally available and cannot and will not make any subsequent claim for copyrights, authors 
rights, exclusivity or similar claims for such content. Consequently, WonderWorld cannot be directly or 
indirectly liable for any loss you suffer as a consequence of such release. 

5. Links to Third Party Sites 



This Site may contain links to websites controlled by parties other than WonderWorld (each a "Third 
Party Site"). WonderWorld works with a number of partners and affiliates whose sites are linked with 
WonderWorld. WonderWorld may also provide links to other citations or resources with whom it is not 
affiliated. WonderWorld is not responsible for and does not endorse or accept any responsibility for the 
availability, contents, products, services or use of any Third-Party Site, any website accessed from a 
Third-Party Site or any changes or updates to such sites. WonderWorld makes no guarantees about the 
content or quality of the products or services provided by such Third-Party Sites. WonderWorld is not 
responsible for webcasting or any other form of transmission received from any Third-Party Site. 
WonderWorld is providing these links to you only as a convenience, and the inclusion of any link does 
not imply endorsement by WonderWorld of the Third Party Site, nor does it imply that WonderWorld 
sponsors, is affiliated or associated with, guarantees, or is legally authorized to use any trade name, 
registered trademark, logo, legal or official seal, or copyrighted symbol that may be reflected in the links. 
You acknowledge that you bear all risks associated with access to and use of content provided on a 
Third-Party Site and agree that WonderWorld is not responsible for any loss or damage of any sort you 
may incur from dealing with a third party. You should contact the site administrator for the applicable 
Third-Party Site if you have any concerns regarding such links or the content located on any such 
Third-Party Site. 

6. Additional Terms 

Some of our services may be subject to additional posted guidelines, rules or terms of service 
("Additional Terms") and your use of such services will be conditioned on your agreement to the 
Additional Terms. If there is any conflict between these Terms and the Additional Terms, the Additional 
Terms shall prevail for that service, unless the Additional Terms expressly state that these Terms will 
prevail. 

7. Security 

WonderWorld takes online security seriously and have put in place such measures as may be reasonable 
expected to maintain system security and keep personal data safe, hereunder implementing necessary 
measures as required by applicable legislation and the EU GDPR regulation. If you have reason to believe 
system security has been breached, contact us immediately at: hello@wonderworld.land 

If WonderWorld's technical staff finds that files or processes belonging to a member pose a threat to the 
proper technical operation of the system or to the security of other members, WonderWorld reserves the 
right to delete those files or to stop those processes. If the WonderWorld technical staff suspects a 
username is being used by someone who is not authorized by the proper user, WonderWorld may 
temporarily disable that user's access in order to preserve system security. In all such cases, 
WonderWorld will contact the user as soon as can be expected. 

Under no circumstances will a WonderWorld representative ask you to provide your personal data or 
passwords. You should keep your passwords in a safe, off-line location, be aware of phishing attempts via 



e-mail or other communication channels, avoid using WonderWorld while logged into public networks 
and always keep the latest version of your anti-virus and firewall software. 

In addition, you hereby expressly undertake the following to help us maintain security: 

-        You will not provide any false personal information or create an account for anyone other than 
yourself without permission. 

-        You will not create more than one personal account. 

-        If we disable your account, you will not create another one without our permission. 

-        you will not use WonderWorld if you are under 18 years of age or 21 where applicable. 

-        You will keep your contact information accurate and up-to-date. 

-        You will not share your password or let anyone else access your account or do anything else that 
might jeopardize the security of your account. 

-        You will not transfer your account to anyone without permission from Wonder World. 

-        If you select a username or similar identifier for your account, we reserve the right to remove or 
reclaim it if we believe it is appropriate (such as when a trademark owner complains about a 
username). 

8. NO WARRANTY 

THE SITE AND ALL RELATED SERVICES AND ALL MATERIALS, DOCUMENTS OR FORMS 
PROVIDED ON OR THROUGH YOUR USE OF THE SITE ARE PROVIDED ON AN "AS IS" AND 
"AS AVAILABLE" BASIS. TO THE FULLEST EXTENT PERMITTED BY LAW, WONDERWORLD 
EXPRESSLY DISCLAIMS ALL WARRANTIES OF ANY KIND, WHETHER EXPRESS OR 
IMPLIED, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF 
MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, TITLE AND 
NON-INFRINGEMENT. 

WONDERWORLD MAKES NO WARRANTY THAT: (A) THE SITE OR THE MATERIALS WILL 
MEET YOUR REQUIREMENTS; (B) THE SITE OR THE MATERIALS WILL BE AVAILABLE ON 
AN UNINTERRUPTED, TIMELY, SECURE OR ERROR-FREE BASIS; (C) THE RESULTS THAT 
MAY BE OBTAINED FROM THE USE OF THE SITE OR ANY MATERIALS OFFERED 
THROUGH THE SITE OR APPLICATIONS, WILL BE ACCURATE OR RELIABLE; OR (D) THE 
QUALITY OF ANY PRODUCTS, SERVICES, INFORMATION OR OTHER MATERIAL 
PURCHASED OR OBTAINED BY YOU THROUGH THE SITE OR IN RELIANCE ON THE 
MATERIALS WILL MEET YOUR EXPECTATIONS. 



OBTAINING ANY MATERIALS THROUGH THE USE OF THE SITE IS DONE AT YOUR OWN 
DISCRETION AND AT YOUR OWN RISK. WONDERWORLD SHALL HAVE NO 
RESPONSIBILITY FOR ANY DAMAGE TO YOUR COMPUTER SYSTEM OR LOSS OF DATA 
THAT RESULTS FROM THE DOWNLOAD OF ANY CONTENT, MATERIALS, INFORMATION 
OR SOFTWARE. 

NOTWITHSTANDING THE ABOVE, YOU HAVE COMPLAINT RIGHTS AND RIGHTS OF 
CANCELLATION ACCORDING TO APPLICABLE LEGISLATION. 

9. LIMITATION OF LIABILITY AND INDEMNIFICATION 

EXCEPT AS PROHIBITED BY LAW, YOU WILL HOLD WONDERWORLD AND ITS OFFICERS, 
DIRECTORS, EMPLOYEES, AND AGENTS HARMLESS FOR ANY INDIRECT, PUNITIVE, 
SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGE, HOWEVER IT ARISES (INCLUDING 
ATTORNEYS' FEES AND ALL RELATED COSTS AND EXPENSES OF LITIGATION AND 
ARBITRATION, OR AT TRIAL OR ON APPEAL, IF ANY, WHETHER OR NOT LITIGATION OR 
ARBITRATION IS INSTITUTED), WHETHER IN AN ACTION OF CONTRACT, NEGLIGENCE, 
OR OTHER TORTIOUS ACTION, OR ARISING OUT OF OR IN CONNECTION WITH THIS 
AGREEMENT, INCLUDING WITHOUT LIMITATION ANY CLAIM FOR PERSONAL INJURY OR 
PROPERTY DAMAGE, ARISING FROM THIS AGREEMENT AND ANY VIOLATION BY YOU OF 
ANY STATE, OR LOCAL LAWS, STATUTES, RULES, OR REGULATIONS, EVEN IF 
WONDERWORLD HAS BEEN PREVIOUSLY ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH 
DAMAGE. EXCEPT AS PROHIBITED BY LAW, IF THERE IS LIABILITY FOUND ON THE PART 
OF WONDERWORLD, IT WILL BE LIMITED TO THE AMOUNT PAID FOR THE PRODUCTS 
AND/OR SERVICES, AND UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES WILL THERE BE CONSEQUENTIAL 
DAMAGES. AS TO THE EXTENT LAWS OR REGULATIONS DO NOT ALLOW THE 
EXCLUSION OR LIMITATION OF INCIDENTAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES THE PRIOR 
LIMITATION OR EXCLUSION DOES NOT APPLY. 

10. Unsolicited Submissions 

Except as may be required in connection with your use of WonderWorld Services, WonderWorld does 
not want you to submit confidential or proprietary information to us through this Site or any Applications. 
All comments, feedback, information or material submitted to WonderWorld through or in association 
with this Site shall be considered non-confidential and WonderWorld's property. You acknowledge that 
you are responsible for the submissions that you provide, including their legality, reliability, 
appropriateness, originality and content. 

 ​11. Right to Refuse 

You acknowledge that WonderWorld reserves the right to refuse service to anyone and to cancel user 
access at any time. 



12. Cancellation/refund policy 

WonderWorld’s services to you shall be deemed to commence upon you choosing a paid service or 
product at WonderWorld’s Site or applications and the chosen service or product is thereafter made 
available to you. You do hereby expressly acknowledge that when such service or product is made 
available you accept these terms accordingly. You do not have any right of cancellation except as 
provided for in this Cancellation/refund policy. However, WonderWorld will try to accommodate 
cancellations provided you send a written request to our customer service immediately after the service or 
product has been made available to you clearly requesting such cancellation and the reason thereof. 

If accepted, WonderWorld will refund payment/s already made for such service or product to your chosen 
bank account. 

In the event of user access being revoked or terminated under these Terms of Use otherwise than as stated 
in this clause any payments made ​will not be refunded. 

13. Choice of law and dispute resolution 

Any dispute arising from or in connection with these Terms of Use and Privacy Policy shall be governed 
by Australian law without regard to any choice of law rules. The parties commit to finding an amicable 
solution before referring a dispute to court proceedings. If the parties are not able to find such amicable 
solution within 30 (thirty) days calendar each party may appoint a third party which shall try to reach an 
amicable solution on their behalf. Failing same within additional 30 (thirty) days, the parties may submit 
the dispute to the ordinary courts of Adelaide, Australia​. 

 ​14. Acknowledgement.​ BY USING WonderWorld's SERVICES OR ACCESSING THE WonderWorld 
SITE, YOU ACKNOWLEDGE THAT YOU HAVE READ THESE TERMS OF USE AND AGREE TO 
BE BOUND BY THEM. 

WonderWorld PRIVACY POLICY: 

WonderWorld takes the handling of your personal data seriously and have implemented internal routines 
for the handling of personal data. WonderWorld’s Privacy Policy, systems and internal routines have been 
developed in order to adhere to the requirements of the Australian Privacy Principles (APPs), which are 
contained in schedule 1 of the Privacy Act 1988 and the EU’s General Data Protection Regulation which 
came into force in May, 2018 and applies to the handling of all EU citizen personal data, regardless of 
where the service provider is based. We strongly recommend that you read and get acquainted with this 
Privacy Policy. Before using our Site, applications and services you will be asked to provide different 
consents to let us use your personal- and personal data in order to provide you with and improve our 
services and user experience. If you at any time would like to opt out of these, you can do so in your 
profile settings or if not available by contacting:  hello@wonderworld.land 

We acknowledge that there are always room for improvement of systems and processes and invite you to 
submit your feedback or suggestions to us at: hello@wonderworld.land  if you think that there are ways 



we could improve our Privacy Policy practices or if you think that the data you have submitted to us is not 
handled in accordance with the above legislation. 

As part of our business model and revenue streams WonderWorld may allow third party service providers 
to advertise and perform marketing activities on our platform. Please see 3 below. 

By using WonderWorld’s Site and services, you accept the terms of this Privacy Policy as follows: 

Definitions: 

Personal data: “Personal data” means data submitted, stored, sent or received to or via the WonderWorld 
Site or applications by a user such as your name, address, phone number, and email address or financial 
data such as your credit card number, expiration date, and verification code or bank account information, 
IP address or other "legal data" such as your social security number or other information relating to you as 
an identified or identifiable person. 

GDPR: General Data Protection Regulation is the EU regulation on data protection and privacy for all 
individuals within the European Union. It also addresses the export of personal data outside the EU. The 
GDPR aims primarily to give control back to citizens and residents over their personal data and to 
simplify the regulatory environment for international business by unifying the regulation within the EU. 

1.     ​What information do we collect from users 

1.1 Personal Data we require from you 
  
In order to open an account, you will be asked to provide us with your full legal name, national 
identification document such as passport and or driving licence and email address in compliance with 
Know Your Customer (KYC) and Anti-Money Laundering (AML) policies. 
  
To complete your personal profile, you will have to upload a personal picture, video or animation which 
we can confirm identifies you as a person according to your identification document. 
  
If you fail to provide this data when requested, we may not be able to perform the contract we have or are 
trying to enter into with you. In this case, we may have to cancel the product or service. 
  
We will only use your personal data when the law allows us to. Most commonly, we will use your 
personal data in the following circumstances: 
  
Where we need to perform the contract, we are about to enter into or have entered into with you; 
Where it is necessary for our legitimate interests (or those of a third party) and your interests and 
fundamental rights do not override those interests; 
Where we need to comply with a legal or regulatory obligation. 
  



Please refer to the details outlined in this Privacy Policy accordingly. 
  
1.2 Traffic/visitor Data.​ WonderWorld may collect a variety of visitor data such as IP addresses​ ​, 
browser settings, internet service provider (ISP) information, referring/exit pages, operating systems, 
date/time stamps, and clickstream data. The WonderWorld internal servers and software may 
automatically recognize such visitor data. The Site may use visitor data to compile data about the types of 
visitors who use the Site at specific intervals (collectively "Traffic Data"). 
We may use Traffic Data to analyse Site traffic, but this information is not examined for Personal data. 
We may also use Traffic Data to diagnose problems with our server, administer our Site, or display 
content according to your preferences. Traffic Data may be shared with business partners, affiliates, or 
advertisers on an aggregated and anonymous basis​[NL12] ​. 
1.3 Web Beacons.​  We may employ a software technology called clear gifs (a.k.a. web beacons), that 
help us track referrals from our partners and affiliates and better manage content on our Site.  Clear gifs 
are tiny graphics with a unique identifier, similar in function to cookies, and are used to track the online 
movements of web users.  In contrast to cookies, which are stored on a user’s computer hard drive, clear 
gifs are embedded invisibly on web pages and are about the size of the period at the end of this sentence. 
We do not tie the information gathered by clear gifs to our customers’ Personal data. 
1.4 Third Party Tracking.​  The use of tracking technologies by our service providers, technology 
partners or other third parties (such as social media links) on the Site is not covered by our Privacy Policy. 
These third parties may use cookies, clear gifs, images, and scripts to help them better manage their 
content on our Site.  We do not have access or control over these technologies.  We do not tie the 
information gathered to our users’ Personal data. You should get acquainted with the privacy policy of 
such third parties when interacting with them. 
1.5 Testimonials and Reviews.​  We may display personal testimonials of satisfied customers or customer 
reviews from public forums or elsewhere. We will ask for your specific consent before publishing if it 
includes personally identifiable information. If you wish to update or delete your testimonial, you can 
contact us at:  hello@wonderworld.land 
1.6 Calls/Electronic Communications.​ In the regular course of our business, WonderWorld may monitor 
and record phone conversations or email communications between you and WonderWorld employees for 
training and quality assurance purposes. We may receive a confirmation when you open or click on 
content in an email from us, which helps us make our communications to you more useful and interesting. 
If you do not wish to receive email from WonderWorld, you may unsubscribe from our mailing list by 
using a "Unsubscribe" or similar link on any of the emails we send. 
  
2.     ​How do we use the information we collect, and do we share the information we receive? 
  
We use information we collect from our services to communicate with you, process your orders, facilitate 
your transactions with or through third-parties, and inform you of offers and discounts. For example, you 
may receive a welcome email that confirms your username and password, and later receive 
communications responding to your inquiries, providing services you request, and managing your 
account. We occasionally send service-related announcements, for example, to alert you if we need to 
temporarily suspend the Site for maintenance. 



  
2.1 Promo, Newsletters, Opting Out.​ We send promotional emails and newsletters from time to time to 
users who have registered on the Site and to those who have opted in to receive such emails. Generally, 
you may not opt-out of service-related or transactional communications, which are not promotional. If 
you do not wish to receive service-related communications, you may terminate your account in your 
account settings or by contacting customer care at:  hello@wonderworld.land 
  
2.2 Surveys, Sweepstakes, and Contests.​  We may provide you the opportunity to participate in surveys 
on our Site, to measure customer satisfaction.  If you participate, we may request certain personally 
identifiable information from you. Participation in these surveys, sweepstakes, or contests is completely 
voluntary and you therefore have a choice whether or not to disclose this information. The requested 
information typically includes name and email address. 
  
We use this information to notify contest winners and award prizes, to monitor Site traffic or personalize 
the Site, and/or to send participants an email newsletter. 
  
We may use a third-party service provider to conduct these surveys or contests; that company will be 
prohibited from using our users’ personal information for any other purpose. We will not share the 
personal information you provide through a contest or survey with other third parties unless you give such 
permission by opting in. 
  
3.     ​We share customer information with third parties only as follows: 
  
3.1 Order Processing.​ WonderWorld, sometimes with the assistance of a third party or WonderWorld 
subsidiary, may use your Personal data to process your payment through merchant account services, and 
to generate the products and services you order.  Your Personal data may be used to follow up with you 
on transactions you initiate online, respond to inquiries made online, inform you of changes to our Site 
and services, and send you additional information about WonderWorld and our products and services. 
  
3.2 Third Party Marketing​. Unless specifically authorized by you, we do not provide Personal data to 
third parties for marketing purposes. If you express interest in a third party offer or purchase a package 
that includes a third-party offer, we may provide Personal data to that third party solely in connection 
with the offer you have selected.  If you later decide to opt-out from allowing WonderWorld to share your 
Personal data with third parties for these marketing purposes, you may do so in your account settings or 
by contacting customer care at:  hello@wonderworld.land. ​ ​You may opt in for future marketing by 
contacting the third parties directly unless such option is made available in your account settings. 
  
3.3 Required by Law.​ We may also disclose your personal information: as required by law, such as in 
response to a subpoena, a lawful request by a public authority, including to meet national security or law 
enforcement requirements, or similar legal process, and when we believe in good faith that disclosure is 
necessary to protect our rights, protect your safety or the safety of others, investigate fraud, or respond to 
a legal request. 



  
3.4 Other Transfers.​ We may share Personal data and other data with businesses controlling, controlled 
by, or under common control with WonderWorld. If WonderWorld is merged, acquired, or sold, or if 
some or all of our assets or equity are transferred, we may disclose or transfer Personal data and other 
data in connection with the associated transactions under this Privacy Policy. WonderWorld will issue a 
notice to our users in the case of one of the above 
  
 4. Third party access 
Third-Party websites​. WonderWorld may maintain links to other websites and other websites may 
maintain links to the Site. This Privacy Policy applies only to WonderWorld.com and its subpages and not 
to other websites accessible from WonderWorld or that you use to access WonderWorld, each of which 
may have privacy policies materially different from this Privacy Policy. If you visit other websites, 
WonderWorld is not responsible for the privacy practices or content of those Sites. It is your 
responsibility to review the privacy policies of non-WonderWorld websites to confirm that you 
understand and agree with them. 
  
Social Media Widgets.​ Our website includes social media features, such as the Facebook “like” button 
and widgets, such as the “Share this” button or interactive mini-programs that run on our Site. These 
features may collect your IP address, which page you are visiting on our Site, and may set a cookie to 
enable the feature to function properly. Social media features and widgets are either hosted by a third 
party or hosted directly on our Site. Your interactions with these features are governed by the privacy 
policy of the company providing it. 
  
  
  
  
5.     ​Accessing and Changing Your Account 
  
Unless available in your account settings, upon request, WonderWorld will provide you with information 
about whether we hold any of your Personal data or other personal information. Please review the 
information below to access, correct, or request deletion of your personal information. 
  
User access to and ability to update Personal data.​ You may visit your personal account profile at any 
time by logging in to your profile. If you no longer desire our services, or if you want to remove your 
Personal data from our Site, you may terminate your account by doing so in account settings or by 
contacting customer care at:  hello@wonderworld.land 
  
Data Retention.​ At minimum, we will retain your information for as long as needed to provide you 
services, and as necessary to comply with our legal obligations, resolve disputes, and enforce our 
agreements.  When such data retention is no longer necessary, we will delete your information 
permanently. 
  



How Secure Is the Personal Information We Collect? 
  
Our commitment to Data Security.​ We strive to make certain that our servers and connections 
incorporate strong encryption and security devices. We have implemented physical, electronic, and 
managerial procedures to safeguard and secure the information we collect. Credit card and personal 
information are transmitted by secure servers (SSL). Unfortunately, no data transmission is guaranteed to 
be 100% secure and we therefore cannot guarantee the security of information you transmit to or from the 
Site, applications, or through the use of our services, and you provide this information at your own risk. 
  
ACCORDINGLY, WE DISCLAIM LIABILITY FOR THE THEFT, LOSS, OR INTERCEPTION OF, 
OR UNAUTHORIZED ACCESS OR DAMAGE TO, YOUR DATA OR COMMUNICATIONS BY 
USING THE SITE, APPLICATIONS, AND OUR SERVICES. YOU ACKNOWLEDGE THAT YOU 
UNDERSTAND AND ASSUME THESE RISKS. 
  
IF YOU BELIEVE YOUR PRIVACY HAS BEEN BREACHED THROUGH USE OF OUR WEBSITE, 
APPLICATIONS, OR OTHER SERVICES PLEASE CONTACT US IMMEDIATELY AT: 
hello@wonderworld.land 
  
Enforcement.​ We periodically review this Privacy Policy and our compliance with it to verify that both 
are accurate. We encourage you to contact us with any concerns, and we will investigate and attempt to 
resolve any complaints and disputes about our privacy practices. 
  
Changes to this Privacy Policy.​ We may update this Privacy Policy to reflect changes to our information 
practices. If we make any material changes a notice will be posted on the Site along with the updated 
Privacy Policy prior to the change becoming effective. We encourage you to periodically review this page 
for the latest information on our privacy practices. 
  
Contact Us.​ If you have any questions regarding our Privacy Policy, please contact us on the information 
below. 
  
 hello@wonderworld.land   

 
 
 
 

 


